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For immediate release  
 
7 July, 2016 
 

Medical Protection’s Balancing Risks and Challenges conference to 
help doctors reduce their risk and manage their wellbeing – July 23 
 
Focussing on the preventative value of education in reducing the risks that arise from practice, 
Medical Protection’s second annual Balancing Risks and Challenges conference for consultants 
and senior doctors will be held at the Dublin Convention Centre on 23 July.  
 
Over 150 participants will hear Guy Hirst, Former Chief Instructor at British Airways, present on 
human factors and system errors, and Professor James Lucey, Medical Director at St Patricks 
University Hospital, discuss the importance of looking after themselves. By the close of the 
conference, participants will have a better understanding of how to safely navigate their way 
around risk and protect their careers against complaints. 
 
Dr Richard Brennan, GP, MPS Council Member and Former Chairman of the ICGP Council, will 
chair the conference, and Professor Freddie Wood, President of the IMC, will provide the keynote 
address. 
 
Dr Pallavi Bradshaw, Senior Medicolegal Adviser at Medical Protection and speaker at the 
conference said: 
 
“The ability for a clinician to understand and work through ethical issues in practice is as important 
as clinical acumen and can be the difference between a satisfied patient, and a dissatisfied one 
who makes a complaint or brings a claim. Balancing Risks and Challenges will assist consultants 
and senior doctors to identify and manage risk, and will cover topics such as dealing with difficult 
colleagues, adverse events, and keeping out of the press. It will also assist delegates to gain 
knowledge and skills to practise safely and ethically in the face of the increasing challenges of 
modern day practice.” 
 
Ends. 
 
For further information about Balancing Risks and Challenges, or to arrange a press pass for the 
event, please contact Shannon Darling, Press Officer at Medical Protection on +44 (0)20 7399 
1319 or shannon.darling@medicalprotection.org  

 
Notes to editor 
 

1. Balancing Risks and Challenges conference for consultants and senior doctors will be 
held on 23 July, 2016, at the Convention Centre in Dublin. For further information or to 
book a place, please call +44 (0)113 241 0530 or visit: 
http://www.medicalprotection.org/ireland/education-and-
events/events/events/2016/07/23/default-calendar/balancing-risks-and-challenges-
conference  
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About Medical Protection  

Medical Protection is a trading name of The Medical Protection Society Limited (“MPS”). The 
Medical Protection Society Limited (“MPS”) is the world’s leading protection organisation for 
doctors, dentists and healthcare professionals. We protect and support the professional interests 
of more than 300,000 members around the world. Membership provides access to expert advice 
and support together with the right to request indemnity for complaints or claims arising from 
professional practice.     
 
Our in-house experts assist with the wide range of legal and ethical problems that arise from 
professional practice. This can include clinical negligence claims, complaints, medical and dental 
council inquiries, legal and ethical dilemmas, disciplinary procedures, inquests and fatal accident 
inquiries.  
 
Our philosophy is to support safe practice in medicine and dentistry by helping to avert problems in 
the first place. We do this by promoting risk management through our workshops, E-learning, 
clinical risk assessments, publications, conferences, lectures and presentations.  
 
MPS is not an insurance company. All the benefits of membership of MPS are discretionary as set 
out in the Memorandum and Articles of Association. 
 
 
 
 


